

JUDICIAL TAX SALE LIST  
MAY 26 2022 - 1PM  
MAIN COURTROOM

5/26/2022 1:54 PM

2022 JUDICIAL SALE

Dist #	Control	Map Number	Name	Description	Opening Bid	Sold For	Bidder
03	002548	CY-371-524800-000	ADAMS, CHRISTOPHER R	34 EAST MAIN ST	\$ 1,974.64	\$ 19,000.00	JEFFREY ZARICZNY
04	015154	WN-548-574500-000	BRINKS TOUR & CHARTER LLC	626 SOUTH STATE ST	\$ 3,899.03	\$ 9,000.00	JAMES YOUNG
04	013983	WN-487-393000-014	SEITHER, BARRY	255 BUTTERNUT CT #LOT 14	\$ 924.50	NO BID	
11	011821	WN-005-688800-002	PHELPS, DAVID	876 PAGE HOLLOW RD	\$ 1,372.30	NO BID	
13	006319	TD-005-280000-321	STAJDUHAR, PAUL	LOT 321 END OF PIPE LINE	\$ 782.00	NO BID	
14	021926	WN-977-255500-000	DANIELS KENNETH P	10226 ROUTE 6	\$ 1,419.77	NO BID	
18	004262	SH-359-172700-000	ANDERSON JASON	120 HIGH ST	\$ 1,935.80	\$ 8,000.00	REN BARNES
18	003959	SH-355-152950-000	BENDEL, DAVID E	650 WEST MAIN STREET	\$ 1,931.68	\$ 4,500.00	STEPHEN LYON
18	004160	SH-355-992600-000	FAUL LARRY L	22 WEST MAIN STREET	\$ 2,076.78	\$ 2,076.78	ELIZABETH MUTHLER
18	004588	SH-367-258200-000	NICHOLSON RODNEY L & ALICE M	320 CHURCH ST	\$ 1,091.01	NO BID	
18	004098	SH-355-843700-012	ROCKWELL KENNETH DEAN	130 BROCKWAY LN #LOT 12	\$ 727.00	NO BID	
18	004273	SH-359-197600-000	SPENCER, KATHY M	89 COTTAGE AVENUE	\$ 1,682.49	NO BID	
20	001347	CY-006-673120-000	LEWIS SCOTT A	0 ROUTE 426 - 2.11 ACRES	\$ 1,053.10	\$ 1,053.10	SPRING CREEK PLAYGROUND ASSOC
20	002617	CY-664-947100-000	LEWIS SCOTT A	0 ROUTE 426 - 1.82 ACRES	\$ 1,125.92	\$ 1,500.00	SPRING CREEK PLAYGROUND ASSOC
20	002570	CY-664-415400-000	LEWIS SCOTT ANDREW	0 ROUTE 426 - .07 ACRES	\$ 1,125.07	NO BID	
37	020621	WN-822-369900-000	SAYBROOK LAND COMPANY	58 LOCUST ST ST	\$ 1,884.24	\$ 3,100.00	JAMES YOUNG
						<b>\$ 48,229.88</b>	

- 1 BROKENSTRAW TOWNSHIP
- 2 CHERRY GROVE TOWNSHIP
- 3 COLUMBUS TOWNSHIP
- 4 CONEWANGO TOWNSHIP
- 6 DEERFIELD TOWNSHIP
- 7 ELDRED TOWNSHIP
- 8 ELK TOWNSHIP
- 9 FARMINGTON TOWNSHIP
- 10 FREEHOLD TOWNSHIP
- 11 GLADE TOWNSHIP
- 13 LIMESTONE TOWNSHIP
- 14 MEAD TOWNSHIP
- 15 PINE GROVE TOWNSHIP
- 16 PITTSFIELD TOWNSHIP
- 17 PLEASANT TOWNSHIP
- 18 SHEFFIELD TOWNSHIP
- 19 SOUTHWEST TOWNSHIP
- 20 SPRING CREEK TOWNSHIP
- 21 SUGAR GROVE TOWNSHIP
- 22 TRIUMPH TOWNSHIP
- 23 WATSON TOWNSHIP
- 24 BEAR LAKE BOROUGH
- 25 CLARENDON BOROUGH
- 26 SUGAR GROVE BOROUGH
- 27 TIDIOUTE BOROUGH
- 28 YOUNGSVILLE BOROUGH
- 29 CITY OF WARREN 1st
- 31 CITY OF WARREN 3rd
- 32 CITY OF WARREN 4th
- 33 CITY OF WARREN 5th
- 34 CITY OF WARREN 6th
- 35 CITY OF WARREN 7th
- 36 CITY OF WARREN 8th
- 37 CITY OF WARREN 9th
- 38 CITY OF WARREN 10th

